
 

ACP Makes Growth Investment in GovTech Platform Schneider 

Geospatial 

June 21, 2022 

 
Align Capital Partners (“ACP”) announced today the recapitalization of Schneider Geospatial, LLC 
(“Schneider Geospatial” or the “Company”), a SaaS provider of public access land management 
software and recurring support services to state and local governments. As one of the largest 
providers of GovTech geospatial solutions in the U.S. with a presence in over 25 states, the 
Company’s software allows citizens to access disparate government information sources in a more 
efficient and cost-effective manner. 
 
Schneider Engineering Corporation was founded in 1962 and began offering geographic information 
system (“GIS”) services in 1989. After the GIS business grew well organically and through several 
acquisitions, the Schneider family decided to spin out Schneider Geospatial into a separate, 
independent business in 2018 while maintaining 100% ownership of the Company. Through this 
transaction, ACP is providing significant growth capital to Schneider Geospatial, while preserving the 
Schneider family legacy through their continued ownership interest in the Company. 
 
“Our grandfather, Vincent Schneider, had a love for technology that was ahead of his time. Our 
father, John Schneider, embraced this passion and began our GIS business with a keen insight that 
understood the importance of geographic data. We are very proud of Schneider Geospatial, its 
award-winning innovations and the amazing group of employees who have made this all happen. 
We are excited to be associated with Align Capital Partners and we look forward to the future as we 
continue to grow and expand,” said J. Barry Schneider and Victoria Schneider Temple. 
 
Headquartered in Indianapolis, Indiana, the Company’s 50+ person team helps power Schneider 
Geospatial’s cloud-based software platform that enables clients to manage over 500 million 
information requests from over 23 million users, including citizens, commercial real estate 
developers, appraisers, law firms, contractors and inspectors. The Company’s core solution 
combines web-based GIS data reporting tools including CAMA and tax, ownership history, liens, 
boundaries, environmental issues and topography, into a single, user-friendly web application. 
 
Link to original press release: 
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